
VOLUME 122 • NO 5 415

AS I SEE IT

•  •  • 

Author Affiliations: University of Wisconsin 
School of Medicine and Public Health, Madison, 
Wisconsin (Patel). 

Corresponding Author: Anjali Patel, email anpa-
tel5@wisc.edu; ORCID ID 0009-0008-3014-444X

who often learn best through hands-on expe-
rience, were frequently denied of in-person 
training. Moreover, those who struggled faced 
additional barriers, as they could not easily 
meet with their professors or participate in 
study groups. 

A survey conducted in the US among 
medical students found that 43.3% felt unpre-
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The outbreak of COVID-19 changed the 
“normal” for nearly everyone. As an 
undergraduate student on a premed 

track, I believe it has especially affected medi-
cal and premedical students—from education 
and clinical experiences to mental health.  

EDUCATION AND EXPERIENCE
Early in the pandemic, schools nationwide 
were forced to transition classes and clinical 
rotations to online or hybrid learning formats, 
and education among pre-med and medical 
students was greatly altered. 

For example, due to “stay-at-home” orders 
and virtual office visits, many undergraduate 
students were unable to shadow physicians. 
Even after the stay-at-home orders were 
lifted, many physicians refrained from hav-
ing undergraduate students in their offices. 
Though necessary for everyone’s safety, it 
may inadvertently have hindered students’ 
understanding of the medical field and par-
ticular specialties and limited their ability to 
reach the “recommended hours” needed to 
apply to certain medical schools. Additionally, 
both undergraduate and medical students, 

classes and the loss of one-on-one student-
teacher interactions, many of my peers have 
struggled to find and connect with mentors 
during this period. Furthermore, when stu-
dents enter college, it is a time to make new 
connections, learn what the college has to 
offer, and explore their interests, but the pan-
demic limited our ability to do this. 

A survey conducted in the US among 
medical students found that 43.3% felt unprepared 

for their clinical rotations, and 56.7% felt unprepared 
for their board exams due to the pandemic.

pared for their clinical rotations, and 56.7% 
felt unprepared for their board exams due to 
the pandemic.1 Another cross-sectional survey 
of 741 medical students from 6 US medical 
schools showed that 74.9% had their clinical 
rotations either cut short or canceled, and 
93.7% reported not being involved in any clini-
cal rotations that had in-person patient con-
tact.2 

MENTAL HEALTH
For many students, success hinges on having 
mentors for guidance and support. I have been 
fortunate to have had multiple opportunities 
to connect and work with the wonderful doc-
tors at UW Health. My mentors have played a 
pivotal role in my journey, guiding me through 
significant career decisions, obstacles, and 
personal hurdles. Yet with the shift to virtual 

Working with people in-person allows 
students to create their sense of belonging, 
security, and safety. But for some deprived of 
this opportunity, lack of support increases the 
risk of burnout and mental health challenges. 
Three of my peers discontinued their medical 
studies due to pandemic-related stress. One 
recounted the difficulty of balancing academic 
and work responsibilities while isolated, 
leading to depression and loss of direction. 
“As a premed student, I already had a lot on 
my plate – my classes, CNA (certified nurs-
ing assistant) job, research work – but then 
I had to stay confined in a small dorm room 
alone. I could not even go home since flights 
were closed and it got to a point where I was 
severely depressed. I had no motivation, no 
ability to focus and no goal in life. I eventu-
ally dropped the premed major, and I believe 



WMJ  •  2023416

the main reason behind that was I had no sup-
port.” 

A survey done in Changzhi Medical 
College among undergraduates showed a 
correlation between the pandemic and aca-
demic delays and mental health.1 Similarly, in 
Hong Kong, due to exam delays, students lost 
their appetites and developed sleep problems 
due to stress. In the same survey, out of 757 
students, 20% reported stress levels of 10/10 
on exam delays.1 These findings suggest that 
setbacks and cancellations not only caused 
educational deficits, but also affected mental 
health. Further, in a survey of 248 medical stu-
dents from 13 schools, 48% reported feeling 
depression and 52% felt lonelier.1 

In another study, 1139 allopathic medical 
students from Washington and New York were 
assessed for depression and anxiety symp-
toms and self-rated their mental health during 
versus  before the pandemic. Seventy percent 
of respondents reported their mental health 
was worse than baseline following the initial 
months of pandemic; 61% reported experienc-
ing some depressive symptoms (24% meet-
ing criteria for major depression); and 58% 
reported some symptoms of anxiety (20% 
meeting criteria for an anxiety disorder).3 
These findings suggest that over two-thirds 
of the medical students who completed the 

survey believed that their mental health had 
deteriorated after the start of COVID-19. 

There is no doubt that COVID-19 has had a 
negative effect on many medical and under-
graduate students – myself included, and we 
have suffered in obtaining a well-rounded 
experience in the medical field. Fortunately, 
however, although it has been slow, the recov-
ery to “normal” has begun.
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